
Madhuban Beloved Avyakt BapDada’s divine message via Dadi Gulzar 24/04/03 
 
Today, I especially went to BapDada carrying love, remembrance and news of those in the lands abroad 
where a new virus has spread.  Just ahead of me, BapDada was standing there smiling and with a lot of love 
was taking all the children beyond with His drishti.  I too became merged in Baba’s eyes, receiving that 
powerful drishti.  After some time, Baba said: Come child, what news have you brought today of my 
carefree emperor children?  I replied: Baba, You know anyway!  So sweet Baba was giving sakaash to those 
children and then said: Child, in this old world, the elements will continue to show their tamoguni form.  
Sometimes illnesses, sometimes storms and sometimes, earthquakes.  Call it the wonder (kamaal) or chaos 
(dhamal) of the elements and Maya in this iron age, but My children are those who remain seated on the seat 
of a detached observer and watch the drama because BapDada, the Protector is always with the children.  
And now, children have to become spiritual doctors and end the main reason for all those illnesses which is 
disease of the mind, peacelessness and distress.  Doctors always remain safe from any type of infection.  In 
the same way, spiritual doctors remain unshakeable and safe in every type of upheaval.  Saying this, 
BapDada made the children of Hong Kong, China, Singapore etc. emerge in the subtle region and, while 
giving drishti filled with a lot of love, passed His hand of blessings over each one.  What did I see then?  
Beautiful rays were emerging from BapDada’s hands and as these rays were falling on each one, rays of all 
powers began to sparkle on the forehead of each one of them.  Each one appeared to have a powerful 
personality of purity and seeing this I was also very pleased.  After some time, Baba said: Child, always 
“don’t care” about Maya and the different situations of nature (elements) and remain careful in Baba’s 
remembrance, be fearless, incorporeal, continue to fly and make others fly.  After that, Baba remembered 
both Dadis and asked about their health.  I told Baba: Both are very enthusiastic about service no matter 
what else is happening healthwise.  Baba replied: They are My specially beloved children.  BapDada makes 
the specially beloved children move by giving them special companionship and My hand in their hand.  Not 
just making them move, but making them fly.  Saying this, BapDada merged me in His heart and  I came 
back to the corporeal world.  Achcha.  Om shanti. 
 

Letter from Trimurti Dadi s 
 
Beloved Avyakt BapDada’s extremely loving double-foreign brothers and sisters who are being sustained 
by the blessings of the Father, the Bestower of Blessings, and the carefree emperors who constantly 
continue to fly, please accept sweet remembrance of the Trimurti Dadis from your unlimited home, 
Madhuban. 
 
Sweet BapDada emerged all of you in His subtle region and especially made all of you powerful with the 
rays of all powers and gave you a signal to have an attitude of “don’t care” towards Maya and the different 
games of the elements of nature and to remain careful in remembrance.  I am sending you BapDada’s sweet 
and lovely message.  All of you must have filled yourselves in the unlimited home, and having reached your 
service places, must be busy in self-progress and unlimited service.  In Madhuban too, on the one side, 
instrument teachers of Bharat are coming here for the annual accounts meeting and on the other side, 
Dialogue and yoga camp programmes are taking place for VIP’s.  Together with this, Baba also makes us do 
unlimited service.  Very good service also took place in Om Shanti Retreat Centre, Delhi when the President 
of India, the Chief Minister of Hariyana and the Governor visited.  Now, a very big gathering of over 
100,000 brothers and sisters is to take place on Marina Beach in Madras.  Trimurti Dadis will be going 
there.  Then Dadi Janki will also be going back to London. Achcha.   
 
Lots of love and remembrance to all, 
 
B.K. Prakashmani 
 



Today, Dadi Janki took class after BapDada’s murli and gave the inspiration for all children to remain free 
from the influence of manmat and parmat.  Dadi said: Shrimat alone is the means for the flying stage.  To 
follow manmat or to have conflict of opinion makes you bankrupt of Godly love.  The dictates of your mind 
are your own enemy.  Baba has freed us from manmat and conflict of opinion and taught us how to smile.  
Now have mercy on yourself: Don’t listen to or speak of useless things.  Listen to useful things and speak of 
them with a lot of love.  Constantly continue to merge good experiences.  The ears, eyes and mouth are for 
Baba and not for anyone else.  Sharing such a beautiful experience, Dadi said: Once Sakar Baba was coming 
in front of me and, seeing me, asked: Child, what song are you singing in your heart?  Baba has taught me 
how to smile.  (Someone made me belong to Him and taught me how to smile).  Such a sweet Baba who has 
taught me how to smile, brought me into the rosary so that no one can can remove me from that rosary.  So 
Dadi’s good wishes are that all of you should also become part of the rosary with her.  Yesterday, Dadi 
Janki specially remembered all the double foreign children, specially those children where the new virus has 
spread, and gave them remembrance.  BapDada made everyone emerge in the subtle region and the message 
that Baba gave is being sent to you with this.  Achcha.   
 
Lots of love and remembrance to all, 
 
Om Shanti 
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Essence: Sweet children, never remember this physical body (Brahma).  Although your eyes see this 
one, you have to remember Shiv Baba, the Supreme Teacher.   

Question: By understanding which law, can you children not accept any flowers and garlands at this 
time?   

Answer: You know that only those who have a pure soul and body are worthy of flowers and garlands.  
Therefore, in accordance with this law, you cannot accept flowers or garlands.  Baba says: I 
too cannot accept your flowers and garlands because I neither become worthy of worship nor 
a worshipper.  I am your obedient Father and Teacher.   

Song:  Leave Your throne in the sky and come down to earth… 
Om shanti.  You sweetest, beloved, long- lost and now found children heard the song.  This song finishes the 
idea of omnipresence.  You recall that Bharat has now become very unhappy.  All of those songs have been 
composed according to the drama.  People of the world do not know that the Father has come to purify the 
impure, that is, He has come to liberate unhappy people from their sorrow.   He comes to remove sorrow 
and bestow happiness.  You children have now received recognition and have come to know that the same 
Father has come.  He Himself sits here and explains: I enter an ordinary body and tell you children the 
secrets of the beginning, the middle and the end of the world.  There is only one world; it simply becomes 
new and old, just as a body is new in childhood and then becomes old.  You would not say that there are two 
bodies, a new body and an old body; there is just one body which simply changes from new to old.  In the 
same way, there is only one world and it has now become old from new.  However, no one can tell you 
when it was new.   Baba comes and explains: Children, when the world was new, Bharat was new, it was 
called the golden age.  That same Bharat has now become old and this is called the old, old world.  From the 
new world, it has become the old world.  It definitely has to become new again.  Children have had visions 
of the new world.  Achcha, who were the masters of that new world?  It must definitely have been Lakshmi 
and Narayan.  The original eternal deities were the masters there.  It is the Father who is explaining to you 
children.  Baba says: Now constantly remember that the Father has come from Paramdham (the supreme 
abode) to educate you by teaching you Raja Yoga.  All praise belongs to the One alone.  There is no praise 
for this one (Brahma).  At this time, everyone’s intellect is degraded; no one understands anything at all.  
This is why I have come and why this song has been composed.   This song finishes the notion of 
omnipresence.  Each one has his own part to play.  Baba repeatedly says: Renounce body consciousness, 
become soul conscious and remember Shiv Baba.  Just consider Shiv Baba to be doing everything and that 
Brahma is not present.  Although your eyes can see this one’s form, your intellect should be drawn to Shiv 
Baba.  If it were not for Shiv Baba, this one’s soul and body would be of no use at all.  Always consider 
Shiv Baba to be in this one and teaching you through him.  This one (Brahma) is not your Teacher.  That 
One is the Supreme Teacher and it is Him you have to remember.  Never remember this body.  When you 
connect your intellect’s yoga to the Father, the notion of omnipresence will no longer remain.  Children 
remember Him and ask Him to come and teach them knowledge and yoga again.  No one except the 
Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, can teach Raja Yoga.  It is in the intellect of you children that the Father 
Himself speaks the knowledge of the Gita.  This knowledge then disappears.  Once the kingdom is 
established and everyone has attained salvation, there is no need for it.  Knowledge is given in order to take 
souls from degradation to salvation.  Everything else belongs to the path of devotion.  Chanting, tapasya, 
penance and charity etc, whatever they do all belongs to the path of devotion.  No one can meet Me through 
that.  The wings of the soul are broken.  Souls have become like stones, so I have to come and change them 
from stone and make them divine.  Baba says: Look how many people there are!  It is as though the world is 
filled with mustard seeds.  They are all going to be destroyed.  There aren’t that many human beings in the 
golden age.  There are plenty of material comforts and very few people in the new world.  Here, there are so 
many human beings that there isn’t even enough food to eat.  The earth is old and barren; later it will 
become new again.  There, everything is new.  Even the name Heaven, Paradise, is so sweet.  It is the new 
world of deities.  There is the desire to demolish the old home and sit in the new one.  There is now just the 
desire to go to the new world of heaven.  This old body has no value at all.  Shiv Baba doesn’t have a body.  
 
*  Words that Baba spoke in English are shown in italics. 
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Children say that they want to place a garland on Him.  However, if you place a garland around this one’s 
neck, your intellect’s yoga will go to this one.  Shiv Baba says: I have no need of garlands.  You are the 
ones who become worthy of worship and you are the ones who become worshippers.  Therefore, you begin 
to worship your own images.  Baba says: I neither become worthy of worship nor do I need to have flowers 
etc.  Why should I accept them?  Therefore, He never accepts flowers.  You can accept as many flowers as 
you like when you become worthy of worship.  I am the most obedient Father, Teacher and Servant of you 
children.  When great and royal people sign their name, they write: “Your humble servant”.  They never 
write “Lord So-and-so” whereas here they write “Shri, Shri Lakshmi-Narayan” or Shri So-and so”.  They 
clearly write the word “Shri”.  So Baba sits here and explains to you children: Children, do not remember 
this body.  Have the faith that you are a soul and remember the Father.  In this old world both the soul and 
body are impure.  When the gold is nine carat, the jewelry will also be nine carat.  Alloy is mixed into the 
gold.  Therefore, do not consider the soul to be immune to the effect of action.  Only you have this 
knowledge.  You attain your reward in the golden age for twenty-one births, and so how much effort should 
you make?  However, you children repeatedly forget to remember that Shiv Baba is giving you these 
teachings through Brahma.  The Brahma soul also remembers Him.   Brahma, Vishnu and Shankar are 
residents of the subtle region.  The Father first of all creates the subtle bodies.  This Brahma, Vishnu and 
Shankar will also play their part and then go back.  The land of nirvana is the highest land of all.  The land 
of liberation of souls is the highest land of all.  All the devotees remember the one God.  However, because 
they have become tamopradhan, they have forgotten the Father and started worshipping stones, pebbles and 
everything else.  We understand that whatever takes place is shot in the drama.  Once the shooting of a 
drama has taken place – for instance, a bird or something flying past – that is what will be repeated in that 
particular scene.  If a butterfly flies by whilst shooting is taking place, that too will continue to repeat.  
Therefore, this drama also continues to repeat second by second.  It continues to be shot.  This drama is 
preordained and predestined and you are the actors.  You watch the whole drama as observers.  Every 
second passes by according to the drama.  If a leaf moves, that happened according to the drama.  It is not 
that each leaf moves according to God’s orders.  All of that is fixed according to the drama.  This has to be 
explained very clearly.  Baba comes and teaches Raja Yoga and gives knowledge of the drama.  The 
pictures that have been made are also very good.  Even the hand (of the clock) is shown at the confluence 
age.  It is the confluence of the end of the iron age and the beginning of the golden age.  There are now 
many religions in the old world.  They will not exist in the new world.  You children should always consider 
it to be the Father who is teaching you.  We are Godly students.  God speaks: I make you into kings of 
kings.  Even the kings worship Lakshmi and Narayan.  I am also the One who makes them worthy of 
worship.  Those who were worthy of worship have now become worshippers.  You children now understand 
that we were the ones who were worthy of worship and that we are the ones who later became worshippers.  
Baba does not become this.  According to the law, you cannot accept flowers.  Only those whose soul and 
body are both pure have the right to accept flowers.  There, in heaven, there are only fragrant flowers.  
Flowers are there for one to take their fragrance.  Flowers are also used for making garlands.  Baba says: 
You children are now becoming the garland around Vishnu’s neck.  You have to sit on the throne 
numberwise.   To whatever extent you made effort in the previous cycle, accordingly you are doing that now 
and will continue to do so, although that too is numberwise.  The intellect says that such-and-such a child is 
very serviceable.  Just as in a shop, someone is the owner, someone else becomes his partner, and another 
becomes the manager, so it is the same here.  You children have to win the mother and father.  You are 
wonder-struck as to how you can go ahead of the mother and father.  The Father makes effort and makes the 
children worthy of claiming the throne.  This is why he says that you win his throne.  You win over each 
other, do you not?  Make so much effort that you become Narayan from an ordinary man.  There is only one 
aim and objective.  It is said that a kingdom is being established but within that there is a variety of status.  
Make full effort to conquer Maya.  Take care of your children etc with a lot of love but as a trustee.  On the 
path of devotion you used to say: God, everything has been given by You.  If He reclaims His property, 
there is no question of crying over that.  However, this is the world of tears.  Human beings relate stories 
and also relate a story of the king who conquered attachment.  There, no one feels sorrow; they shed a body 
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and take another.  There is never any illness there.  The body remains ever-healthy and free from disease.  
Children have had visions of everything: how marriage takes place there what kind of costume they wear 
and what customs and systems they have.  That part has now passed.  At that time, you didn’ t have as much 
knowledge.  Now, day-by-day, you children are receiving a great deal of power with full force.  This part is 
also fixed in the drama.  It is a wonder that even the Supreme Soul has such a huge role.  He Himself sits 
here and explains: Although I only come down once every cycle, I do sit in Brahmand and do a great deal of 
work.  There are many worshippers of the Incorporeal One, but they have lost the knowledge of how the 
incorporeal Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, comes and teaches.  Because they have put Shri Krishna’s 
name in the Gita, their love for the Incorporeal One is broken.   It was the Supreme Soul who taught easy 
Raja Yoga and showed the world.  The world continues to change; the ages also continue to change.  You 
have now come to understand the cycle of this drama.  Human beings do not know anything at all; they 
don’t even know the deities of the golden age.  Only signs of the deities remain.  Baba explains: Always 
consider yourself to belong to Shiv Baba and Shiv Baba to be teaching you.  When you realize that Shiv 
Baba is giving you teachings through this body of Brahma, you will experience a great deal of pleasure 
remembering Shiv Baba.  Who else could be called God the Father?  He is the Father, as well as a Teacher.  
However, it is not possible for that father to be a guru.  A father can also be a teacher but he could never be 
called a guru.  This one’s (Brahma Baba’s) father was a teacher and used to teach.  I also used to study.  
That is a limited father and teacher.  This One is the unlimited Father and Teacher.  Even if you consider 
yourself to be a Godly student, that too is great fortune. God the Father is teaching you. It is so clear!   He is 
such a sweet Father!  Sweet things are always remembered.  A lover and beloved have love for each other.  
Their love is not impure.  They just continue to look at one another, that’s all.  However, your love is love of 
the soul for the Supreme Soul.  The soul says: Baba is such an Ocean of Knowledge and Love that He 
comes into this impure world and enters this impure body and makes us so elevated!  There is also a song 
that says “It didn’t take God long to change human beings into deities.”  You go to heaven within a second.  
You become deities from human beings within a second.  This is the aim and objective for which you have 
to study.  Guru Nanak said: God washes all the impure clothes (souls).  His soap is Lux (laksh – aim).  Baba 
says: I am such a great Laundryman.  I make your clothes (soul and body) completely clean.  Have you ever 
seen such a laundryman?  I make souls that have become totally dirty clean with the power of yoga.  So 
never remember this one (Dada).  This whole task is Shiv Baba’s.  Therefore, remember Him.  He is sweeter 
than this Brahma.  He tells you souls: Although your eyes see the chariot of this Brahma, you have to 
remember Shiv Baba.  Shiv Baba is making you worth diamonds from shells through this one.  Achcha. 
 
To the sweetest, beloved, long- lost and now-found children, love, remembrance and good morning from the 
Mother, the Father, BapDada. The spiritual Father says namaste to the spiritual children. 
 
Essence for dharna: 
1.  Always remain in the awareness that you are Godly students and that God, the Teacher is 

teaching you.  Whilst living at home, become a complete trustee. 
2.  Never accept any flower garlands at this time.  In order to become the garland around Vishnu’s 

neck, make effort to gain victory over Maya. 
Blessing: May you be an embodiment of light giving wandering souls their elevated destination through 

your elevated stage. 
 Just as moths naturally come to a physical light, in the same way, wandering souls will come to 

you sparkling stars at a fast speed.  To achieve this, practise seeing the sparkling star in the 
centre of each one’s forehead.  Whilst seeing bodies, do not see them.  Your vision should 
always fall on the sparkling star (light).  When such spiritual vision becomes natural, 
wandering souls will find their true destination through this elevated stage of yours. 

Slogan: To know the importance of service and remain busy in one service or another is to be an all-
round server. 

* * * O M   S H A N T I * * * 
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Essence: Sweet children, human beings are of no use without purity.  Therefore, you have to help by 
becoming pure and making others pure. 

Question: Without which faith does your life get destroyed instead of flourishing? 
Answer: If you don’t have the faith that the most beloved Father is teaching you, that you have come 

here to study knowledge and yoga and claim an inheritance, your life gets destroyed.  To have 
this doubt means to cancel your fortune.  This is why there is victory in faith.  The Father 
places the mothers in the front.  There is no question of this. 

Song: Who has come to the door of my mind with the sound of ankle-bells? 
Om shanti.  Children say this.  Baba explains: I am neither corporeal nor a deity in the subtle form.  I am the 
Supreme Soul.  It is the soul that says this.  The only word added to soul is Supreme, that is, God.  There is 
praise of the one God whom the devotees remember.  This is called the human world.  It is being jealous 
about this.  You children should not have any doubts or become body conscious about now Ravan’s 
kingdom, the devilish community, the community that causes sorrow for one another.  Who is explaining 
this?  The One whom these eyes cannot recognise.  A soul recognises Him with his intellect when the Father 
gives that recognition.  You are My children.  Just as you are souls, I too am a Soul but, because I am the 
Father, I am called the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul.  Therefore, it is said: God speaks.  It would not 
be said: God Brahma speaks.  It is said: Salutations to the deity Brahma, salutations to the deity Vishnu.  
The one Father Himself says: O children, God Shiva speaks: I am the God of everyone.  Everyone 
remembers Me.  I alone make all the children constantly happy and peaceful.  This isn’t said just for the 
sake of saying it.  They give prizes to people: Such-and-such is a leader who established peace.  Here, it is 
not a question of a human being.  It is that Father who gives all human beings a prize.  You are establishing 
purity, peace and prosperity by following shrimat.  You become helpers and receive the inheritance of 
peace, purity and prosperity exactly as you did in the previous cycle.  You cannot paint an accurate picture 
of the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul.  Brahma has a subtle form.  How could you take a photograph of 
the Supreme Soul who is like a star?  There is only the One Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, and He is 
like a star.  You cannot take a photograph of Him.  A soul recognises Him with his mind and intellect.  
These are new things.  This is why it is explained: Consider yourself to be a soul.  You receive that body 
later.  You souls are imperishable and immortal.  The body is mortal.  The body is young and becomes old.  
You cannot take a photograph of a soul; you can have a vision of it.  You can’t take a photograph of a 
vision you might have, but you can explain it.  You can take a photograph of human beings and deities, but 
not of God.  This is why people are confused.  They are unable to understand anything.  The Father now 
explains: You remain aware of the body for the whole cycle.  You now have to become soul conscious.  In 
the golden age you had a deity body and then you went into the body of a warrior, then a merchant and then 
a shudra.  Now, o soul, you have to change it.  I am speaking to you souls.  You are listening through your 
ears.  No human being can say this.  You have come here to the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, Shiva.  
However, He is Incorporeal.  That Incorporeal One definitely enters a corporeal one and this is why you 
have come.  You are asked: Whom have you come to?  You would say: I have come to Shiv Baba.  This one 
(Dada) is the agent in between because the property belongs to the Grandfather.  If the father were not here 
in between how could there be the Grandfather?  How could you receive the Grandfather’s inheritance?  
Only when you have the father can you receive the Grandfather’s inheritance.  No one without faith can 
come here.  There is no purpose in coming here without faith.  You come here to meet Shiv Baba.  How can 
you belong to Him without taking birth to Baba through Brahma?  This is something to be understood.  
However, Maya has made you senseless so the Father then comes and makes you sensible.  You forgot the 
Father and this is why you have become orphans.  You have been receiving sorrow from the beginning 
through the middle to the end.  For half the cycle you have been experiencing sorrow by indulging in the 
vices and you are now experiencing great sorrow.  The deities who were constantly happy are at this time 
greatly unhappy.  There is a great difference between the fortune of the kingdom of heaven and this.  You 
understand that Shiv Baba is your true Father from whom you receive the inheritance of the land of truth.  
You come here with this understanding.  Otherwise, there is no need to come here.  You go outside and give 
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lectures: Come and study with the Father and you will become deities of heaven.  When someone belongs to 
the deity clan, the sapling takes root.  However, this is the only college or university where you have to 
study every day.  You repeatedly have to remember the Father and also become pure.  Raksha Bandhan, the 
festival of purity, is remembered.  Sisters tie a rakhi on their brothers.  Mothers are the Shaktis.  Their status 
definitely has to become elevated now.  It is said to the brothers: Give regard to these mothers and become 
their helpers.  They have to be saved from all the atrocities.  Because of not understanding fully, people 
relate wrong things and then poor innocent mothers are tied in bondage.  Therefore, those who perform 
wrong actions or obstruct them in claiming an inheritance from the Father accumulate a huge burden of sin.  
You have come here to create your life.  There will be obstacles on this path of knowledge because there is 
the aspect of purity.  Christ was crucified on the cross.  That too was an aspect of purity.  A pure soul comes 
here and tries to make everyone pure.  Then the Pope, priests etc. become gurus.  In fact, gurus should be 
pure.  However, nowadays, they even perform marriage ceremonies.  Human beings are of no use without 
purity.  Here, purity is the main thing.  It is because of this that there are obstacles.  Just as an alcoholic is 
unable to rest without a drink, in the same way, they are unable to stay without poison.  The Father explains: 
I am making you pure from impure, the kings of kings.  When you children come here, you have the 
thought, “Does anyone have doubts?”  Otherwise, the poor innocent mothers become tied in bondage.  In 
that case, there would be great punishment because the Father is also Dharamraj.  We call the Incorporeal 
One the Father, although, nowadays, they even call a mayor Bapuji.  Gandhiji was also called Bapu (father), 
but this One is the real Father of all souls.  This is not useless praise.  The Father means the Father.  I am 
teaching you souls Raja Yoga.  Have no doubt that the Father actually comes.  It is Maya, Ravan, that brings 
doubts.  Doubts are called evil spirits.  Faith is not called an evil spirit.  You gain victory through faith.  
With the evil spirit of doubt, you are led to destruction.  “Why does Baba do this?  Why does Baba praise 
the mothers?”  To have such thoughts is also to have doubts.  The Father says: This is the family path, and 
in this too, the mothers are said to be the gurus.  “Salutations to the mothers.”  No one can benefit without 
the mother gurus.  Even the gopes (brothers) are benefited.  They then serve others.  They bring their friends 
and relatives.  “Come, I will take you to the Brahma Kumaris.  You too are a Brahma Kumar.  Prajapita 
Brahma is very well known.  When the world was created, God must definitely have come and you would 
have become children of Prajapita Brahma.”  Who created Brahma?  The Supreme Father, the Supreme 
Soul, Shiva.  How else would the human world have been created?  Human beings say that God created 
them and so God surely has to enter a body.  What is the name of the body?  Because he renounced 
everything, and he belongs to Him, he is given the name Brahma.  Look how the world is created!  These 
matters are so wonderful!  None of these things are mentioned in the Gita etc.  This is knowledge for 
salvation.  The Father alone is the Bestower of Salvation.  Only the Creator knows the beginning, the middle 
and the end of this world.  Look around the whole world.  Is there anyone, apart from you Brahma Kumars 
and Kumaris, who knows the Creator or the beginning, the middle and the end of creation?  Only the 
children who are gyani souls can know this.  You have to prove that the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, 
is the Father and that He is not omnipresent.  Eventually, everyone will come to understand that it is only 
the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, who gives you this knowledge through Brahma.  Therefore, this 
knowledge is called Brahma-gyan, not brahm-gyan.  You must surely have received it from the Father.  He 
is the Ocean of Knowledge and He is praised.  The urn of knowledge is then given to you mothers.  The 
Father comes and elevates you mothers.  The men also become elevated, but there mustn’t be jealousy about 
this.  Don’t think: Why should the name of the mothers be used?  The Father comes and increases respect 
for the mothers.  The Father gives you children knowledge through Brahma and this is called Brahma-gyan.  
Knowledge is Shiv Baba’s.  Brahma, Vishnu and Shankar cannot be called the Ocean of Knowledge.  
Brahma himself says: I am not the Ocean of Knowledge.  This is the last of many births and I now belong to 
Baba and this is why Baba has given me this name.  Those who are adopted have their names changed.  The 
Father explains to you so clearly.  A big kingdom is being established.  It is written: The flames of 
destruction emerged from the sacrificial fire of the knowledge of Rudra.  Rudra means Shiva.  Krishna was 
a prince.  How could he have created a sacrificial fire?  The God of the Gita is not Shri Krishna.  He didn’t 



13/05/03  Morning Murli     Om Shanti     BapDada  Madhuban 
 

3/3 

create the creation of heaven.  Only the Creator would create that.  Only those who belong to your clan will 
understand these things.  Only the sapling of the deity religion will take root.  You will understand 
according to the extent that they take this knowledge whether they will become part of the sun dynasty, the 
moon dynasty or the subjects.  You all understand that there is no guarantee on your life.  Nowadays, death 
takes place quickly whilst just sitting somewhere.  There is no untimely death in heaven.  People make so 
much effort to keep themselves happy and become wealthy.  If someone receives 5 rupees, he would try to 
receive 6 or 7 rupees.  The Father says: I make you wealthy.  Sannyasis say: Happiness is like the droppings 
of a crow.  What do they know?  The Father explains: Hatha yogis cannot give anyone liberation- in-life.  
Only the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, gives you liberation- in- life through these mothers.  There must 
definitely be men too.  You then have to make effort to make others equal to yourselves.  To the extent that 
you make effort, accordingly you will claim a status.  The majority is of you mothers.  The name Gopal 
(Gaupal – Cowherd) Kanhaiya is remembered.  A bull is not given this name.  There shouldn’t be any body 
consciousness about this.  When you become body conscious, Maya blows you away.  Children come here 
with the faith: We are going to the most beloved Father.  The soul says through the mouth: I am going to the 
Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, to study Raja Yoga and knowledge and claim my inheritance.  
Otherwise, there is no need to come here.  If you don’t come with this thought, doubts will take you away.  
That is, your life will be destroyed.  Then your fortune will be cancelled.  Therefore, it is said: Those who 
have faith in the intellect are victorious whereas those who have doubts are led to destruction.  You should 
make them write down in advance to whom they are going: The Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul.  He 
alone is explaining everything.  The Father explains: On the path of bhakti people have visions of Krishna.  
They do so much intense bhakti.  When they are about to cut their throat.  They say: If I don’t have a vision, 
I will die.  It is after great difficulty that they have a vision.  It is I who grant those visions.  Here, I have to 
give you children visions.  You have an aim and objective.  Visions are granted but you mustn’t become 
content with that.  If you don’t make effort how would you be able to receive the reward?  Therefore effort 
has to be first.  Achcha. 
 
To the sweetest, beloved, long- lost and now-found children, love, remembrance and good morning from the 
Mother, the Father, BapDada.  The spiritual Father says namaste to the spiritual children. 
 
Essence for dharna: 
1. Follow shrimat, become the Father’s helpers, establish peace and purity throughout the whole 

world and claim a peace prize. 
2. Protect the mothers and sisters from atrocities.  Elevate the status of the mothers.  Give them 

regard. 
 
Blessing: May you be a number one victorious soul and constantly fly in the flying stage by becoming an 

elevated one following the highest code of conduct. 
 The sign of number one is one who wins in every situation.  Never be defeated in any situation.  

Always remain victorious.  If you are ever defeated whilst moving along, it is because of 
fluctuation in following the code of conduct.  This confluence age is the age for becoming an 
elevated soul who follows the highest code of conduct.  You are not just an ordinary man or 
woman, but a most elevated being.  Always remain in this awareness and you will continue to 
move into the flying stage.  You will not remain down below.  Those who are in the flying 
stage overcome all problems in a second. 

Slogan: Remain in the elevated company of the one Father and no other company will influence you. 
* * * O M   S H A N T I * * * 
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Essence: Sweet children, may you be soul conscious.  Continue to follow the shrimat of the one Father.  
Your clan is elevated.  You have to become spinners of the discus of self-realisation. 

Question: What are the Father’s directions for the Shiv Shakti Pandava Army? 
Answer: The Father’s directions are: Follow shrimat and take the boat of this Bharat across.  Renounce 

all bodily religions.  Constantly remember Me alone.  Become pure and make others pure.  
You, the Shiv Shakti Pandava Army must become pure and do the service of making Bharat 
pure with your body, mind and wealth.  Serve Bharat truly by following shrimat and with the 
power of non-violence. 

Song: Salutations to Shiva… 
Om shanti. Children, you heard the song.  This is the praise of Incorporeal Shiva, the Supreme Father, the 
Supreme Soul.  He is called God.  God is only One.  The people of Bharat have many gods.  They believe 
cats, dogs, pebbles and stones to be God.  They consider themselves to be God too and this is why God says: 
All of them are atheists.  There is a lot of praise of the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul.  He purifies the 
impure world.  That is, He makes Bharat, that was as poverty-stricken as shells, into a crown of diamonds.  
It is a matter of 5000 years when Bharat was double-crowned.  Who is explaining this?  That Supreme 
Father, the Supreme Soul, who is also called the Ocean of Knowledge.  The praise is of the Father, the 
Creator, and all the rest is creation.  People of Bharat say: You are the Mother and Father and we are Your 
children.  Bharat had plenty of happiness, but it doesn’t have that now.  It is now the devilish community of 
Ravan.  Every man and woman has the five vices present in them.  Kings, queens, sages and holy men are 
all included in this.  They definitely have one voce or another.  This is the impure world, impure Bharat.  
Bharat was pure in the golden age.  It was the pure household religion, the pure family path.  It is now the 
impure family path.  Bharat was double crowned and it had a lot of wealth.  There were palaces studded 
with diamonds and jewels.  The Muslims la ter looted it and put those diamonds and jewels on their mosques 
and graves.  The people of Bharat have become completely poverty-stricken.  Because of forgetting Me, you 
have become atheists.  I make the people of Bharat into deities.  There is the praise: You are the Mother and 
Father.  Therefore, you would surely receive the inheritance of heaven from the Father.  You can receive 
plenty of happiness of heaven from Him.  The Father says: I make you into the masters of heaven by 
teaching you Raja Yoga and knowledge.  The Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, comes and teaches souls.  
He says: May you be soul conscious.  It isn’t that you have to become God conscious.  That is wrong.  God 
is not omnipresent.  The Father is Shiva and the children are saligrams.  Both reside in the supreme abode.  
So all of us are souls.  Sannyasis then say: Brahm-ohum, (I am brahm) there is just the element of brahm 
everywhere.  All the rest is false.  We are brahm too.  Shri Shri 108 Jagadguru, the Purifier, is only One.  He 
alone is called the Satguru.  How can those who reside in the impure world be called the Purifier?  They 
themselves are impure and so how could they purify others?  Those who are at first pure are made to get 
married and made even more impure.  Shiv Baba says: Children, may you be soul conscious.  Have the faith 
that you are a soul.  The Father Himself comes and teaches you Raja Yoga.  Shri Krishna cannot be called 
God.  He is a human being with divine virtues.  He was a prince of the golden age.  The praise of the 
Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, is very great.  He Himself says to souls: O souls, when you were in the 
golden age you were so pure, but you have now become impure.  If you now want to become happy once 
again, then follow shrimat.  The most elevated directions are from God.  On the one hand people say that 
God is beyond name and form and on the other they say that He is omnipresent.  This is called defamation 
of religion.  No one knows that there was the original eternal deity religion in Bharat.  They don’t have any 
knowledge about who established that.  They don’t know the Father, or the beginning, the middle and the 
end of His creation.  Only people would know this, animals would not know this.  Shiv Baba is also called 
Baba.  Then the Brahmin clan is established through Prajapita Brahma.  No human being knows how the 
Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, creates them or how He carries out the sustenance.  Prajapita Brahma is 
the one who creates the human world.  The Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, is also called the Creator.  
He is the Father of souls.  So, all are the children of Shiva.  The Brahma Kumars and Kumaris receive an 
inheritance from that Mother and Father.  Baba says: I gave you birth and so you have to remember Me.  
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You also have to remember your inheritance.  Death is just ahead.  When a person is about to die, he is told 
to remember God.  God Himself now says: Children, follow My shrimat.  There are the directions of the 
Yadavas, others are the directions of the Kauravas and these are the directions of the Pandavas.  The 
Pandavas receive God’s directions.  It is remembered: Those who had a non- loving intellect at the time of 
destruction.  Pandavas have a loving intellect.  You know that this is the land of falsehood.  It was the land 
of truth 5000 years ago when the deities ruled there.  The people of Bharat were the masters of the whole 
world.  They are not that now.  You are now once again becoming the masters of the world.  In the golden 
age, there was the kingdom of the World Almighty Authority.  It is not that now.  The Father says: I am 
establishing that once again.  All the other religions will end.  You now remember the Supreme Father, the 
Supreme Soul, the Purifier.  Consider yourself to be a soul.  It is said: A sinful soul and a charitable soul.  In 
Bharat, all were charitable souls and now they are sinful souls.  You would not say: Charitable Supreme 
Soul.  You children are now completing your 84 births.  I have now come to take you children back home.  I 
am your unlimited Father and also your Teacher.  I tell you the secrets of the unlimited history and 
geography and make you into the spinners of the discus of self-realisation.  Deities are not spinners of the 
discus of self-realisation.  The clan of Brahmins is the most elevated.  Brahmins are the top-knot, the 
children of Prajapita Brahma who are to become deities.  The Father says: At first you were Brahmins, then 
you became warriors, then merchants and then shudras.  You continued to take rebirth.  I am now giving 
you these teachings once again and making you into deities.  At this time, the people of Bharat are 
absolutely in a graveyard and they give themselves big titles: The Sarvo Daya Leader.  Sarva means all 
human beings of the world, and to have mercy for all of them.  Human beings cannot do this.  Only the one 
Father is called knowledge-full, blissful.  Baba now says: Renounce all bodily religions.  Constantly 
remember Me and your sins will be incinerated in the fire of yoga.  It isn’t that the Ganges is the Purifier.  
Only the one Father is the Purifier.  You are the Shiv Shakti Pandava Army who remain pure.  You mothers 
of Bharat are the Shiv Shakti Pandava Army who are making this Bharat into heaven with your body, mind 
and wealth.  On the one side is non-violence and on the other side is violence.  What are they doing and 
what are you doing?  There is the memorial.  It is the memorial of the service you did 5000 years ago.  You 
are doing service.  This is knowledge.  There is no question of blind faith in this.  You used to go to the 
Shiva Temple, but you didn’t know that Shiv Baba is the Creator of heaven, and that you should definitely 
receive the inheritance of heaven from Him.  God would always give you children an inheritance of heaven.  
This is why everyone remembers Him and says: Oh Purifier, come!  Oh Baba, come and once again give us 
our fortune of the kingdom of heaven.  Come and grant us liberation- in-life.  God alone is the Bestower of 
Salvation.  You are the Shiv Shakti Pandava Army who become pure and make others pure.  You are those 
who take the boat of Bharat across by following shrimat.  You have received the Father’s shrimat: Renounce 
all bodily religions and constantly remember Me alone.  He is the Father, the Truth, the Living Being, the 
Ocean of Knowledge, the Ocean of Happiness.  He comes to teach you children.  The Father speaks to you 
souls.  It is the soul that listens.  It is the soul that does everything.  The Father says: You are long- lost and 
now-found, you are the ones who were separated for a long period of time.  This is why they say that the 
soul is the Supreme Soul.  Which souls come from the supreme abode (Paramdham) first?  Those who have 
to stay here till the end.  Those deities existed at the beginning of heaven.  They are the ones who have taken 
the complete 84 births.  When the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, comes, souls who have been 
separated from the Father for a long period of time are the ones who come first and claim their inheritance 
from the Father.  Children, whilst living at home with your family, remember Baba.  Stay as pure as a lotus.  
Follow shrimat and become as elevated once again.  You experienced a lot of happiness for half the cycle 
and then Maya, Ravan, made you fall by making you follow devilish dictates.  Those who were the sun 
dynasty then became the moon dynasty.  You have now once again become Brahmins from shudras.  You 
are incognito.  No one recognises you.  Unlimited Bapuji says: I am the Bapuji (Father) of the whole world.  
I alone will establish heaven.  The limited Bapuji (Gandhiji) got rid of the foreigners.  This One will take 
you away from this world.  The many religions are being destroyed and the one religion established.  Only 
those who understood all of these things in the previous cycle will understand them.  Those who came into 
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the sun-dynasty kingdom will come and rule again.  This is a big tree.  The sapling of the original eternal 
deity religion is now being planted.  The iron age is the forest of thorns and the golden age is the garden of 
flowers.  Those who give one another happiness are called the deity community.  Those who cause sorrow 
are called the devilish community.  Shiv Baba comes and establishes Shivalaya.  He is making you into the 
masters of heaven.  To the extent that you make effort, so you will claim a status.  There was at first the 
deity community in Bharat and then it became the devilish community, that is, the shudra community.  You 
are now once again becoming the deity community.  You have now become the Godly community and will 
then become deities.  Understand this cycle very well.  Achcha. 
 
To the sweetest, beloved, long- lost and now-found children, love, remembrance and good morning from the 
Mother, Father, BapDada.  Salutations to the mothers.  The spiritual Father says namaste to the spiritual 
children. 
 
Essence for dharna: 
1. Give everyone happiness and become part of the deity community.  Don’t perform any task of 

the devilish community.  Become a helper in establishing Shivalaya. 
2. Remain soul conscious.  Whilst living at home with your family, remember only the one 

Father.  Incinerate your sins in the fire of yoga. 
 
Blessing: May you be a complete soul full of power and with the consciousness of belonging, receive 

drishti of love and mercy. 
 BabDada, the Ocean of Mercy, gives the return of multimillionfold spiritual loving drishti to 

those children who recognise the Father and say “My Baba” from their heart even once.  The 
drishti of love and mercy constantly makes them move forward.  This spiritual consciousness 
of belonging becomes a blessing for those children to fill themselves with power.  BapDada 
doesn’t need to give blessings through words because every child is being sustained with subtle 
loving thoughts. 

Slogan: Those who love the Father cannot love any other person or physical comforts. 
* * * O M   S H A N T I * * * 
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Essence: Sweet children, Shiv Baba is the altruistic number one Trustee.  Transfer your old bags and 
baggage to Him and you will receive everything new in the golden age. 

Question: Which children does the Father have to take care of in every way? 
Answer: The Father is very concerned about the children who whilst having faith in their intellect give 

their full news to the Father and take directions from the Father at every step.  Baba says: 
Sweet children, you must never have doubts about shrimat.  If you have doubts, Maya will 
cause great harm.  She will not allow you to become worthy. 

Song: I have come to your doorstep having taken an oath… 
Om shanti.  Sweetest, beloved, long- lost and now-found children heard the song.  Those who belong to the 
Father are called children.  The Father has explained that you have to belong to the Father for as long as you 
live in this final birth in which you have died alive.  You children know that shrimat is remembered as: 
“God speaks”.  They have written Krishna’s name in that Gita, but first is Shiv Baba, then Brahma and then 
Krishna.  So shrimat is not said to be of Krishna.  He is a human being with divine virtues.  Human beings 
cannot be called the Purifier.  Only the one Father is the Purifier of the impure and you are following His 
shrimat.  The incorporeal Supreme Soul is the Father of all religions.  Not everyone believes in Krishna.  
Christians believe Christ, not Krishna, to be their father because Christians are the mouth-born creation of 
Christ.  Shiv Baba comes and makes you belong to Him.  He says: You now belong to the Father with your 
head in your hand (with that regard) in order to follow His directions.  Children don’t need to give Him 
directions.  He Himself is the One who gives you directions.  You mustn’t ask: Why does Baba say this?  
No, all are the children.  Shiv Baba is very well known.  The directions He gives and whatever He does will 
be right.  Whatever He makes this corporeal one (Brahma) do would also be right because He is 
Karankaravanhar.  He gives him directions too: Do this!  Your connection is with Shiv Baba.  You mustn’t 
look at anyone’s defects.  Follow shrimat.  Shiv Baba is the Incorporeal, the detached Observer.  He doesn’t 
have a home here.  You are staying here in a home that doesn’t belong to you.  You will then go to heaven 
and live in your own home.  Shiv Baba says: I will not live there.  I come at the confluence age for a short 
time.  You are the true spiritual Salvation Army.  The Supreme Father is giving you directions, exactly as He 
did in the previous cycle.  He will give the same directions that He gave in the previous cycle.  He continues 
to tell you the deepest points, day and night.  A new person wouldn’t be able to understand them.  The murli 
has continued from Karachi.  At first, Baba didn’t speak the murli.  Baba would wake up at 2.00 in the 
morning and write 10 to 15 pages.  Shiv Baba used to make him write that and then copies of those were 
made.  On the path of bhakti, they continue to make great big books.  They keep those.  How much would 
you keep?  You know that all of this is to be destroyed.  All the pictures etc. are also for a short time and 
then they will be buried underground.  There, there won’t be any scriptures or pictures.  Whatever is 
happening now will happen again after a cycle.  The scriptures etc. will begin from the copper age.  The 
Father says: You cannot find the way to the supreme abode from those.  The Granth was very small to begin 
with and now, day by day, they continue to make it bigger.  In fact, a big book should be written of Shiv 
Baba’s biography.  You children know the Father’s biography.  The Father explains what He does on the 
path of bhakti.  I insure everything even on the path of bhakti.  People donate in the name of God.  They 
say: He did something in the name of God for this is why he has taken birth in a wealthy family.  In bhakti, 
there are many righteous souls.  Baba says: I have been giving children the temporary fruit of that in their 
next birth.  You receive good and bad fruit.  It is such a big insurance.  Each one receives fruit according to 
the actions he or she performs.  Maya makes you perform wrong actions through which you receive sorrow.  
I now teach you such actions that you will never experience sorrow.  Maya doesn’t exist there, and so each 
of you can insure yourself as much as you want.  Shiv Baba is also the number one Trustee.  Some are 
attracted to other things.  Some trustees ruin everything of others.  Look how Baba is a Trustee.  He says: 
All of this is for you children.  Your full connection is with Shiv Baba.  The Father says: I am the true 
Trustee.  I Myself don’t take that happiness, but I give the whole kingdom to you children.  This Baba also 
says: I have fully insured everything.  Body, mind and wealth are all being used for Baba’s service.  There is 
a saying in Sindhi: Those who give a handful receive a palace in return.  Look, a building has been built 
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now.  Someone sent one rupee and asked for a brick to be put in their name.  Oh, because you are poor, you 
will receive the best palace of all.  I am the Lord of the Poor.  One rupee of a poor person is equivalent to 
10,000 rupees of a wealthy person.  Both receive the same status.  Wealthy people hardly ever come here.  
Kumaris are the most free.  Look how Mama claimed number one.  Baba gave everything, but nevertheless, 
first is Lakshmi and then Narayan.  This is such a wonderful play.  Never have any doubts about anything.  
Do not have the slightest doubt at all.  Become very sweet.  Take shrimat at every step.  Otherwise, Maya 
will cause great harm.  So many children have to be given directions.  Baba says: Give your full news.  
Baba will take care of you in every way.  Baba is very much concerned for children to become elevated.  
You should pay full attention to the study.  You are the most beloved God-fatherly students.  “God speaks” 
is also remembered, but they have put Krishna’s name.  Krishna is the highest of all human beings.  They 
also mention Krishna’s name as the first number, but why not that of Narayan?  Krishna is young and 
satopradhan.  Then he goes through the stages of youth and old age.  It is said that a child is equal to a 
brahm-gyani.  A small child doesn’t commit sin.  People celebrate the birthday of Krishna.  They have 
shown him in the copper age.  The Father alone explains all of these things.  At this time, you Brahmins are 
the most elevated.  You are the children of God.  In the golden age you would not be called the children of 
God.  You will definitely attain heaven from God.  This is your most invaluable, precious life.  It cannot be 
like this for everyone.  This drama is predestined in this way.  Those who studied in the previous cycle are 
studying now.  God definitely created gods and goddesses.  However, we cannot call them gods and 
goddesses, because God is One.  All the praise is of the Incorporeal One.  There cannot be praise of a 
corporeal being.  The Incorporeal One made Lakshmi and Narayan become like that.  You too are becoming 
the masters of heaven through the Father.  You are studying Raja Yoga.  Raja Yoga is truly mentioned in the 
Gita.  At the time the kingdom was established, destruction also took place.  It is now the confluence age.  
When Shiv Baba comes, He brings the play to an end.  Then the birth of Krishna takes place.  They build 
very big temples on the path of bhakti.  There used to be wealth worth multimillions in those temples.  Now, 
all of that has disappeared.  From studying the scriptures of the path of bhakti, from going on pilgrimages, 
from building temples and spending so much money, Bharat has become poverty-stricken.  It is as though 
you have now become master knowledge-full.   The Father is the Ocean of Knowledge, the Ocean of 
Happiness, and blissful.   All of this is praise of the Father.  The Father says: Bharat is the best pilgrimage 
place.  However, by putting Krishna’s name, they have lost all respect.  Otherwise, everyone would offer 
flowers at the Shiva Temple.  The Bestower of Salvation for All is the One.  You experience the reward for 
half the cycle and then you continue to come down.  Everyone has to become tamopradhan.  The Father 
says: Now, give all your bags and baggage and I will transfer them and give them to you in the golden age.  
I Myself do not take it.  People do everything for themselves and then say that they are doing it selflessly.  
However, no one can do anything selflessly.  You definitely receive the reward of everything you do.  I give 
you children the imperishable jewels of knowledge.  I bring Paradise for you.  I give you children the 
souvenir (gift) of sovereignty.  So you have to become worthy to receive them.  You have to become the 
masters of heaven.  You receive heaven on the palm of your hand.  You receive liberation- in-life in a second 
and the sovereignty in a second.  Shiv Baba is the Bestower of divine vision.  He takes you to Paradise in a 
second.  This Baba doesn’t hold that key.  The Father says: I give you children the kingdom.  I Myself do 
not rule.  Then, when you go onto the path of bhakti, I will entertain you with divine visions.  The Father 
explains to you so well.  Baba only comes once every cycle, at the confluence age of the cycle.  They say 
that He has many incarnations but all of that is lies.  The scriptures all belong to the path of bhakti.  That 
which is predestined is taking place; nothing is to be created now.  Whatever happens is fixed in the drama.  
Just see that as a detached observer.  Baba explains to you very clearly: Children, I am your Insurance 
Magnate.  I do not lose even one penny of yours.  I change you from shells into diamonds.  Shiv Baba does 
all of this through this one.  He is Karankaravanhar.  He is incorporeal and egoless.  Look how God, the 
Father, sits here and teaches you.  He doesn’t ask you to fall at His feet.  The Father is the Obedient 
Servant.  The Father says: The ones I made into the masters experienced a lot of happiness at first, but they 
have now become unhappy.  They also receive a lot of happiness.  No other religion has this much 
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happiness.  You cannot ask why the people of Bharat have it and why not others.  There are so many people 
and not all can come there.  The drama is predestined.  The original eternal deity religion was only in 
Bharat.  God came and taught true Raja Yoga.  The Father says: I have come once again.  You have played 
your part of 84 births and you are now going back to your home.  This costume has become very old.  There 
is the example of the snake.  Sannyasis say that souls merge with the Supreme Soul.  They stay in such a 
stage and then leave their body.  However, no one merges with the brahm element.  Nevertheless, some 
amongst them are very clever.  They sit peacefully and leave the ir body.  The brahm element is not Baba.  
That is just an illusion of those poor people just as the Hindus have the illusion that they belong to the 
Hindu religion.  Oh, but where did the Hindu religion come from?  That is the name of Hindustan.  There 
was just the one religion in the golden age.  Look how many religions there are now!  There are so many 
languages.  There, there is just the one language.  They say that there should be one Government, but how 
would all the Governments become one?  They don’t even understand brotherhood.  They say that God is 
omnipresent and so that becomes a Fatherhood.  So if they call themselves the Father, whom would they 
call?  This too is also something to understand.  Achcha. 
 
To the sweetest, beloved, long- lost and now-found children, love, remembrance and good morning from the 
Mother, the Father, BapDada.  The spiritual Father says namaste to the spiritual children. 
 
Essence for dharna: 
1. Do not see the weaknesses of others.  Make a connection with one Shiv Baba.  Consider the 

shrimat you receive from Baba to be right and continue to follow it.  Never have doubts about 
shrimat. 

2. Fully insure your body, mind and wealth.  Take shrimat at every step.  Pay full attention to the 
study. 

 
Blessing: May you be an easy yogi and tour around the three worlds in a second with the viman 

(aeroplane) of the intellect. 
 BapDada gives you children an invitation: Children, put on the switch of your thoughts and 

reach the subtle region and take the rays of the sun, the coolness of the moon, have a picnic and 
play games.  For this, the viman of the intellect just needs double-refined petrol.  Double-
refined means, firstly, to have the intoxication of faith in the Incorporeal One, and that you are 
a soul, a child of the Father and secondly, to have the intoxication of all relationships in the 
corporeal form.  This intoxication and happiness will make you an easy yogi and you will 
continue to tour around the three worlds. 

Slogan: Only the knowledge of elevated action is the pen for drawing the line of elevated fortune. 
* * * O M   S H A N T I * * * 
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Essence: Sweet children, surrender everything you have, including your body, and then take care of it all 
as a trustee and your attachment to it will be removed. 

Question: What method should each Brahmin child definitely learn? 
Answer: Definitely learn the method of doing service.  Have the interest to prove who God is.  You 

have received the Father’s shrimat: Become sensible and give everyone the Father’s message.  
Print such good introduction cards that people come to know that calling God omnipresent is 
to insult Him.  You children can serve pilgrims very well. 

Song: What can storms do to those whose Companion is God? 
Om shanti. You children heard the song.  Only you children understand the meaning of this, for those who 
sang this song don’t understand the meaning of it at all.  Neither do they have God with them nor do they 
know when God comes and gives His children their inheritance of heaven.  The Father Himself came and 
personally gave His children His introduction.  That Father is now personally sitting in front of you and you 
are listening to Him.  Only you understand the meaning of storms.  Those people consider calamities to be 
storms.  The storms that you experience are the storms of the five vices of Maya.  Maya creates many 
obstacles to your efforts.  However, you must not be concerned about them.  Simply remember Baba very 
well and the storms will go away.  The son of an emperor would have the faith that his father is an emperor 
and that he is the master of that sovereignty.  He would have that intoxication.  Amongst you children too, 
some of you have this firm faith and have made the Father belong to you.  To make Him belong to you is 
not like going to your aunty’s home!  Mine is one Shiv Baba and none other, that’s all!  Many children don’t 
understand these things.  This is why the storms of Maya harass them and they then leave the Father.  No 
one in the world knows God accurately.  You children were originally residents of Shivalaya (the Temple of 
Shiva).  This is now the brothel.  At this time, human beings have become worse than monkeys.  The anger 
of human beings is worse than that of monkeys.  Even though they are human beings they perform such 
actions, and this is why they are called worse than monkeys.  No one knows who the greatest enemy of 
Bharat is, who made them worse than monkeys.  The Father says: Look at your face in the mirror of your 
heart: What were you before?  The Father is now making you worthy.  However, Maya makes those who 
don’t follow shrimat unworthy.  The Father gives you shrimat: Surrender everything you have including 
your body.  Then Baba will make you a trustee and enable you to end your attachment to it.  It is very easy 
for you innocent mothers.  When the kings of Rajasthan don’t have their own children, they adopt children.  
When wealthy parents adopt a poor child, he becomes so happy: I am a master of so much property.  
Children of wealthy people also have a lot of intoxication that they are the children of multimillionaires.  
They don’t know anything about this knowledge.  You know how you have so much intoxication of this 
knowledge.  By following shrimat you become elevated whereas by not following shrimat, you don’t 
become elevated.  God says: You don’t have to be concerned about anything.  Day and night you should 
have the intoxication that Baba is giving you the inheritance of the kingdom of heaven for 21 births.  We 
have become Baba’s children.  In fact, all are children of Shiv Baba, but Shiv Baba has now come and made 
you His children in a practical way.  You are now sitting here personally and you know that Shiv Baba has 
made you belong to Him and is giving you directions to make you worthy of heaven: Children, don’t 
become trapped in anyone’s name and form.  Only keep the name and form of Shiv Baba in your intellect.  
His name and form are different from those of human beings.  The Father says: You used to belong to Me.  
You used to live in the land of nirvana.  Have you souls forgotten that you are residents of the supreme 
abode, the land of peace, the land of nirvana (beyond sound) and that your original religion is peace?  This 
body is the organ with which to perform actions.  How else would you play your part?  You don’t know at 
all that we souls are residents of the incorporeal world.  Only human beings would know all of these things.  
Animals would not know them.  They have said that God is omnipresent and they have thereby forgotten 
that they themselves are souls.  They say that the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, sent Christ and 
Abraham here.  Therefore it was surely the Father who sent them here.  You know that everyone continues 
to come here according to the drama.  There is no question of sending anyone anywhere.  At this time 
human beings are in the darkness of ignorance.  They neither know the Father nor themselves or the 
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creation.  I am a soul and this body is separate.  We souls have come from there.  Baba alone reminds us of 
all of these things and He says: Remind everyone else too.  You have had a very good invitation card 
printed.  It also has a picture of Shiva.  This is Baba, this is Lakshmi and Narayan, the inheritance.  It is 
written: Come and claim your inheritance from the Father to become like Lakshmi and Narayan.  You are 
students who are changing from human beings into Narayan.  When children of wealthy people are 
studying, they become so happy.  However, they are nothing compared to us.  They make effort for 
temporary happiness.  You children receive constant happiness.  Only you can say this.  Wherever you go, 
you should always have an invitation card with you.  Explain to them it is written on the card: “This is the 
Father of all souls, the Creator of heaven, and how you can receive the inheritance of heaven from Him.”  
You can drop these invitation cards from aeroplanes.  You can even print it in newspapers.  Then, big, 
eminent people will receive an invitation.  These aeroplanes are for destruction and also for your service.  
Poor people cannot do this work, but the Father is the Lord of the Poor.  Only the poor receive an 
inheritance.  Wealthy people are trapped in attachment.  Their heart shrinks in surrendering themselves.  It is 
only at this time that the fortune of kumaris and mothers becomes bright.  The Father says: I have to uplift 
Bharat, sages, scholars and holy men through you mothers.  As you progress further, they will all come.  At 
the moment they think that there is no one like them.  They don’t know that the Father taught you Raja 
Yoga whilst you were living at home.  Their hatha yoga and renunciation of karma is separate.  God 
definitely comes and makes you into the masters of heaven.  Therefore, you should have so much happiness.  
On the path of bhakti,  Baba used to keep a picture of Lakshmi and Narayan with him with a lot of love.  He 
would be very happy seeing the picture of Shri Krishna.  Baba explains to you children: If you want to 
benefit yourself and others, busy yourself in service.  The aim and objective is very clear.  The inheritance is 
the deity world sovereignty.  Up above is Shiv Baba and below Him are Lakshmi and Narayan.  It is so easy 
to explain this.  So, invite everyone.  You are definitely to receive the inheritance of heaven from the 
unlimited Father.  You must definitely distribute these leaflets where many people go.  No one can say 
anything to you.  If anyone does say something, we can explain and prove to him: How can you say that the 
Father from whom we receive the inheritance of heaven is omnipresent?  The Father says: Look, you are 
insulting Me in this way.  I made you into the masters of heaven and you then said that I am in the pebbles 
and stones!  You are now receiving shrimat: Distribute many of these leaflets.  Groups of people go on the 
pilgrimage to Amarnath and you can go there and distribute these leaflets.  Written on them should be: I 
cannot be found by having sacrificial fires, doing tapasya and going on pilgrimages etc.  However, those 
who explain to them have to be sensible.  You have to explain that He is God, the Father.  When you simply 
say “Bhagwan, Ishwar, Paramatma”, the word “Father” is not included.  When you say “God the Father” 
the word “Father” is also included.  All of us are children of the one Father.   If God is omnipresent, has He 
now become impure?  He is the Highest on High.  That is also a temple built as a memorial to Him.  
Therefore, you children should have the interest to do service tactfully.  You can go on pilgrimages and do a 
lot of service.  Those people are physical pilgrims whereas you are spiritual pilgrims.  You should explain to 
them: Where are you going?  Shankar and Parvati reside in the subtle region.  How could they have come 
here?  All of that is the path of bhakti.  So you can do a lot of service in this way.  Devotees, poor people are 
stumbling around everywhere.  Baba feels sorry for them.  Tell them: You have forgotten your religion.  
Who established the Hindu religion?  There is a lot of service to be done.  You children have to become 
alert.  The Father has come to give you the inheritance of heaven but in spite of that Maya catches hold of 
you by the nose and completely turns your face in the opposite direction.  Therefore, remain very cautious 
of Maya.  You children are now sitting personally in front of BapDada.  The world doesn’t know that the 
Father has personally come here.  The light of all souls has been extinguished.  It hasn’t been totally 
extinguished; a little light still remains.  Baba comes and pours the oil of knowledge.  When a person dies, 
people light an earthenware lamp.  Here, the light of the soul is awakened with yoga.  You continue to 
imbibe knowledge.  Ancient Raja Yoga of Bharat is very well known.  Those of the path of isolation teach 
many different types of hatha yoga.  There is no benefit through that.  They continue to come down.  No one 
except Yogeshwar can teach yoga.  It is God who teaches you yoga.  He is Incorporeal.  The Father says: I 
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am teaching you yoga.  Your part of 84 births has now ended.  Some take 84 births, some take 60 and some 
even take 1 or 2 births.  You children have to do a lot of service.  Bharat itself was heaven.  It was the 
kingdom of gods and goddesses.  No one, apart from you, can explain these things.  You are the ones who 
have to take insults.  Baba had to take them, so can’t you children do the same?  You have to tolerate the 
assaults.  That too is fixed in the drama.  The same will happen again.  I am now making the intellects of 
you children divine.  You should remember a great deal the Father who makes you into the masters of the 
world.  He says: Children, may you remain alive!  Claim the kingdom of heaven.  Can you not remember 
such a sweet Father?  Only through remembrance will your sins be absolved.  The account of sin that still 
remains has to be settled here.  If you don’t have yoga, there will have to be punishment.  At that time, Baba 
will grant you visions.  You belonged to Me, you divorced Me and then became a traitor.  You had visions 
in the beginning.  Achcha. 
 
To the sweetest, beloved, long-lost and now-found children who are always safe and sound, love, 
remembrance and good morning from the Mother and Father.  You children have to understand that you will 
shed your body and go to your  sweet home.  There is no pleasure at all in living here.  We are now going to 
Baba.  We have to remember Baba alone.  From there we will then go to the land of heaven.  This 
pilgrimage is very wonderful.  Maya causes a lot of obstacles in this.  Achcha. 
 
To the sweetest, beloved, long- lost and now-found children, love, remembrance and good morning from the 
Mother, the Father, BapDada.  The spiritual Father says namaste to the spiritual children. 
 
Essence for dharna: 
1. Keep the name and form of Shiv Baba alone in your intellect.  Do not become trapped in the 

name and form of anyone else. 
2. Don’t be concerned about the storms of Maya.  Mine is one Shiv Baba and none other: remove 

all storms in this way. 
 
Blessing: May you be full of all powers by bringing in your life all subtle powers with the exercise of 

practice. 
 Mother Brahma has spiritual attachment to the children.  Therefore, with the subtle invocation 

of love, he emerges a group of special children to the subtle region and gives them the 
nourishment of power.  Just as you were given ghee (clarified butter) to eat and also made to 
exercise, in the same way, Baba gives you ghee in the subtle region too, that is, he gives you 
things of subtle power and also makes you do the exercise of practising.  He makes you run a 
race of the three worlds through which you receive special care in your life and all children 
become full of all powers. 

Slogan: Souls who remain stable in their self-respect also enable others to move forward by giving 
them respect. 

* * * O M   S H A N T I * * * 
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Essence: Sweet children, this knowledge is very enjoyable.  Each of you is earning an income for 
yourself.  You must not be concerned about anyone else.  Forget even that body of yours and 
engage yourself in earning. 

Question: What is the way to earn an imperishable income?  Who remains deprived of this income? 
Answer: In order to earn this imperishable income stay awake at night and at amrit vela and continue to 

remember the Father.  Churn the ocean of knowledge.  You never yawn or fall asleep when 
you are earning an income.  Stay in remembrance of the Father whilst walking and moving 
around and you will earn at every second.  You have to earn independently for yourself.  Those 
who are greedy for that perishable income remain deprived of this imperishable income. 

Song: Awaken oh brides, awaken!  The new age is about to dawn! 
Om shanti.  You children heard the song and it has sat in your intellect.  You can call Him the Bridegroom 
or the Father.  Why is He called the Husband of all husbands?  In English it is said: Brides, and the 
Bridegroom is called the Bridegroom.  He is the incorporeal Bridegroom.  Here, there is no question of a 
corporeal bridegroom.  Even the incorporeal Bridegroom definitely needs a bride.  Otherwise, without His 
bride, how would the incorporeal Bridegroom create creation?  You children know through which bride the 
Incorporeal One creates creation.  That Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, enters this one and awakens 
everyone.  You have truly come here to go to the new age, that is, to the land of truth.  The iron age is called 
the old age.  So you children now experience that you have come here to the Ocean of Knowledge to be 
refreshed and to imbibe knowledge personally, face to face.  Children don’t enjoy themselves as much at the 
centres as they do here personally.  You children are personally face to face here whereas those at the 
centres are far away.  It has been explained to you children that every soul is a charioteer and that the 
Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, is the Charioteer of this body.  He is called the Supreme Father, the 
Supreme Soul.  He too is a Soul.  He always resides in the land beyond.  When people remember God, their 
vision definitely goes upwards.  They say: Oh Supreme Father, Supreme Soul, have mercy!  Everyone 
knows that He is the One who resides up there.  The Father has entered the chariot He has appointed.  He 
says: every cycle I become the Charioteer of this one because I establish the Brahmin clan through this 
chariot, Brahma.  If He were to enter the body of Krishna, it would then be the deity clan and it would be the 
golden age.  The body of Krishna exists in the golden age.  You children understand that the unlimited 
Father is sitting here, giving you the knowledge of the three aspects of time and making you trikaldarshi.  
He is giving you the knowledge of the beginning, the middle and the end of the drama.  The moment that 
has passed will repeat identically.  For instance, there was the kingdom of Lakshmi and Narayan, and it will 
repeat again.  Christ too has to repeat his own part.  He will exist again in that same name, form, land and 
time.  The Father says: I have changed My incorporeal form and come here in the corporeal form.  He 
definitely enters a human body, for only then can He speak to us.  In the scriptures, they have written about 
the incarnations in the fish and the alligator.  Because of the notion of omnipresence, they believe that He 
enters everything.  The Father Himself now says: Brides, I have come to awaken you and establish the new 
world.  The golden age that existed will repeat again.  The new age is now about to come.  The world 
believes that there are still 40,000 years left before the new age comes.  This is a big mistake of human 
beings.  You children now have faith in your intellect.  This is definitely new knowledge for the people of 
the world.  In the golden age, there will be deities and they won’t know anything about other religions.  
Now all the old religions exist.  The new deity religion has disappeared and that new religion is now being 
established.  There are images of the deities.  You understand that they truly used to rule in the golden age.  
There, you won’t know that, after the kingdom of Lakshmi and Narayan, there is going to be the kingdom of 
Rama.  You will continue to observe whatever happens.  It is said: Edward the First, Edward the Second.  
Those who come later will be aware that Edward the First and Second existed in the past.  They won’t know 
when they will exist again.  The part of the drama will continue to emerge.  Baba alone explains to you the 
knowledge of the drama.  The pilgrimages of the path of devotion are completely unique.  This is 
knowledge.  Remember the Father and the inheritance.  You now know the duration of the kingdom of 
Lakshmi and Narayan in the golden age and then, in the silver age, Rama and Sita will rule.  You children 
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can see the scenes and scenery.  It is in your intellect that you have completed your 84 births.  This is new 
knowledge.  The Father says: I come at the confluence age of the cycle.  The Supreme Father, the Supreme 
Soul, becomes the Charioteer at this confluence age to take all of us charioteers, us souls, back home.  All of 
us are charioteers.  Consider yourself to be a soul.  You children repeatedly forget this.  We souls have 
played our part of 84 births.  Baba has now come and is explaining all the secrets to us.  He changes us 
impure ones and makes us as pure as He is.  This is the only unlimited Father who makes you children equal 
to Himself.  A physical father never makes his children equal to himself.  A father has children and one 
would be a carpenter, another one would be a surgeon and another an engineer.  It is not like that here.  
Here, all of you change from human beings into deities.  You don’t become a barrister or a surgeon etc.  
You know that the Supreme Father, the Supreme Soul, is teaching you and that by studying this you become 
deities.  You would never have seen such a school anywhere else where everyone says that they are 
studying to claim a deity status.  There continues to be expansion day by day.  Later, the buildings will also 
continue to increase.  When the influence of you children spreads, many people will invite you: Come here 
and teach us the Raja Yoga to change human beings into deities.  There will continue to be a lot of 
expansion.  The Father still says to the children: Stay awake at night and at amrit vela.  There is a lot of 
income in this.  People who are very keen to earn an income even stay awake at night when they have 
customers.  If people were to receive money 24 hours a day, they would renounce their sleep.  Whilst 
earning, you don’t fall asleep.  When you don’t earn, you yawn and fall asleep.  When earning, there is great 
happiness.  People try to increase their wealth so that they remain happy.  However, otherwise, the stomach 
only needs one chappati.  While in this world you children must not have attachment.  You mustn’t be too 
greedy.  Your intellect’s yoga runs towards that, then you remain deprived of this imperishable income.  
Therefore, be very concerned about this income.  You are earning second by second.  Then, if you 
remember the Father whilst walking and moving around, there is further great income.  Are you able to earn 
the other income whilst walking and moving around?  This is a wonderful income.  You are earning 
independently for yourself.  A physical father would be concerned for his children that they should remain 
happy and have enough to eat.  There is no question of worrying about children etc. here.  You have to earn 
an income for yourself for 21 births.  This is such enjoyable knowledge.  Each of you children has to earn 
for yourself.  You mustn’t even remember your children or friends and relatives.  Don’t even remember 
your own body.  Although Baba has to enter this body, He is still soul conscious.  He enters a body at this 
time and gives you souls knowledge, that is, He shows you an easy way to earn an income.  You can earn a 
great deal if you continue to practise this.  Baba also practises remembering the Father so that the habit is 
instilled.  He forgets himself and remembers Shiv Baba because Shiv Baba has entered him.  This Baba 
understands that He is a master of Brahmand.  Children of a physical father are aware that they have a right 
to their father’s property.  So this Brahma Baba is also aware that he is a master of Brahmand and that Baba 
has entered him.  Therefore, he has the intoxication that he is a master of Brahmand and also a master of 
that property.  Shiv Baba Himself doesn’t become the Master of the world.  I become a master of Brahmand 
and also a master of the world.  Baba is just the Master of Brahmand.  You too become masters of the 
world.  Kings and subjects all believe themselves to be masters of the world.  You know that you are 
masters of the world.  By understanding this, your mercury of happiness will remain high.  It is 
remembered: If you want to know about supersensuous joy, ask the gopes and gopis of Gopi Vallabh.  It 
isn’t said: Ask Gopi Vallabh.  Vallabh is the Father.  Vallabh, the Father, is not going to receive the 
happiness of becoming a master of the world.  The Father elevates you so much.  This Brahma also 
considers himself to be a master of Brahmand.  No one in the whole world would consider himself to be a 
master of Brahmand.  It isn’t that anyone will merge with the brahm element.  There is a vast difference in 
merging with the brahm element and becoming a master of Brahmand.  You know that Baba is making you 
into masters of the world.  The Father Himself says: Awaken, brides, awaken!  Everything I explain to you 
is new.  Did you not become the masters of Brahmand?  You have played your part, you are now becoming 
the masters of Brahmand, and then you are going to become the masters of the world.  Remember this all 
the time.  This is called churning the ocean of knowledge.  Your mercury of happiness will rise very high 
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through this.  You should have the faith that this One is your Father.  No one except the Father can explain 
these things to you.  Note these down in your heart.  Here, you take notes to remember them.  They will not 
be useful later.  A barrister has many books, but when he leaves his body, everything is finished.  You can’t 
tell what he will become in his next birth.  You children just have the one study.  You know that the Father 
Himself, the Master of Brahmand is making you into masters of Brahmand, and masters of the world.  In 
spite of that, why doesn’t your mercury of happiness rise?  Baba has explained: You should keep these 
songs in your home to refresh yourselves.  Some think that they have incurred a loss after coming into 
knowledge.  There is profit and loss in the old world anyway.  Today, someone is an advisor, but if someone 
shoots him, everything is finished.  Everyone continues to experience loss.  Some people’s wealth remains 
buried underground.  Everyone experiences loss.  Only you children have profit for all the time in the future 
and that too is for 21 births.  However, all the rest of the world are in loss.  All of this is like a mirage.  No 
one is aware that all of this is going to turn to dust.  Everyone has been burnt and is in the graveyard.  You 
know all of this.  Amongst you too, those who are very clever are aware that this world is like a haystack.  
Everything is going to get buried.  The Yadavas and Kauravas all became buried and there was victory for 
the Pandavas.  They gained victory over the world, that is, over the new world, because you Pandavas know 
God and have love for Him.  To the extent that you have love for Him and you remember Him, to that 
extent you earn an income.  Have you ever heard this before?  The ancient yoga of Bharat is very well 
known.  This Baba didn’t know it either.  Now he has all the things in his intellect.  Baba says: The 
knowledge I give to you, that of the beginning, the middle and the end of the world, will not exist in the 
golden age.  There, the part of your reward of happiness that was enacted will be enacted again.  Only once 
does the Father come and give  this knowledge and He will continue to give it till the end.  No matter where 
you may be, when you leave your body, you should have remembrance of Shiv Baba and the knowledge of 
being trikaldarshi.  Let there be the nectar of knowledge on your lips and remembrance of the discus of self-
realisation, and only then should you leave your body.  That is a saying from the path of bhakti, whereas 
these are matters of the path of knowledge.  When a person is about to die, they put a rosary in his hand and 
ask him to chant the name of Rama so that he can receive salvation.  However, no one knows who Rama is 
or where He is.  Some remember Rama and others remember Hanuman.  To remember many beings is 
called bhakti.  You now just remember the One who gives you knowledge and grants you salvation.  
Achcha. 
 
To the sweetest, beloved, long- lost and now-found children, love, remembrance and good morning from the 
Mother, the Father, BapDada.  The spiritual Father says namaste to the spiritual children. 
 
Essence for dharna: 
1. In order to stay in permanent happiness, churn the ocean of knowledge.  Maintain the 

intoxication that you are going to become the masters of Brahmand and the world. 
2. Have true love for the one Father and earn a true income.  We souls are charioteers of our 

bodies.  Consider yourself to be a charioteer and practise being soul conscious. 
 
Blessing: May you be a flying bird who with unbroken remembrance finds a solution to all problems. 

When you experience Baba to be yours, you automatically remember the One who belongs to 
you.  You don’t have to make effort to remember Him.  To say “mine” means to have a right to 
Him.  Baba is mine and I belong to Baba.  This is called easy yoga.  Become such easy yogis 
that whilst remaining absorbed in loving remembrance of the one Father, you continue to move 
forward.  This unbroken remembrance will solve all problems, make you a flying bird and take 
you into the flying stage. 

Slogan: Become experienced in the power of churning and your wealth of knowledge will continue to 
increase. 

* * * O M   S H A N T I * * * 
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The truly co-operative ones are true yogis. 
 
Today, Baba is looking at the love of the children for the meeting.  By remaining under the canopy of one 
faith and one strength, with the zeal and enthusiasm of the meeting, no upheaval was able to shake their love 
even slightly.  You changed the obstructions and tiredness and experienced it to be an easy path of love and 
arrived here.  This is called “children having courage and the Father giving help.”  Where there is courage, 
there is also enthusiasm.  If there is no courage, there is no enthusiasm.  The children who constantly 
maintain courage and enthusiasm claim number one through their constant stage.  No matter how severe a 
situation may be, with the wings of zeal and enthusiasm and with the elevated flying stage, you will 
experience in a second the biggest and most severe situation to be small and easy because, in front of the 
flying stage, everything is experienced to be like the little toys of a game.  No matter how fearsome some 
situations may be, instead of being fearsome, you will experience them to be natural.  You will experience 
painful situations to make you determined.  No matter how sorrowful the situations that come to you may 
be, the drums of happiness will not allow there to be any influence of the scenes of sorrow.  Instead, with 
peace and power, you will help everyone else by working like cool water on their fire of pain and sorrow.  
At such a time: desperate souls need help.  It is through this co-operation that they will experience elevated 
yoga.  Everyone will accept this true co-operation of yours to be that of true yogis.  At such a time of 
distress, with the revelation of “truly co-operative souls are the true yogis” and from the attainment in a 
practical way there will be cries of victory.  There is the praise of such a time, “Thirsty for one drop…”  
This drop of the experience of one second’s peace and power will enable desperate souls to experience 
fulfilment.  At such a time, the attainment of one second will give them the experience of having received 
the attainment and fulfilment of many births in a second.  However, only a soul who has the practice of a 
powerful stage over a long period of time will be able to quench the thirst of thirsty souls in a second.  Now 
check: Are you able to be a master bestower of fortune, a master bestower of blessings and a master ocean 
and in a second give the experience of such a powerful stage in the midst of a fearsome and sorrowful 
atmosphere of sorrow and pain?  If, at such a time, you become engaged in watching or listening to “What 
has happened?” you won’t be able to be co-operative.  Even the slightest desire for watching or listening 
will not allow you to create the powerful stage where you can fulfil everyone’s desires.  Therefore, from 
now, constantly practise the powerful stage of being ignorant of the knowledge of any temporary desires.  
Become those who are constant servers and constantly co-operative and yogi in their every thought and at 
every breath.  Just as a broken idol has no value, and doesn’t have a right to be worshipped, in the same 
way, a server or a yogi who is not constantly engaged in that doesn’t have the right to enable souls to claim 
a right at such a time.  Therefore, the time for such powerful service is now coming close.  Time is ringing 
the bells.  Just as devotees ring bells to awaken their special beloved deities, and then put them to sleep and 
offer bhog etc., in the same way time is ringing the bells and alerting you special deities.  You have 
awakened but you have become busier in the pure household.  Time is ringing the bells for you to quench 
the thirst of thirsty souls and is making preparations for you to practise creating a powerful stage to bring 
attainment for many births in one second.  Time is invoking you complete specially beloved souls to open 
the curtains of revelation.  Do you understand?  All of you have heard the bell of time, have you not?  
Achcha. 
 
To those who easily overcome all adverse situations with the flying stage; to the constant servers, constant 
yogis, constant master bestowers, embodiments of bestowers of blessings, who enable souls to become fully 
satisfied with the attainment of a long period of time in a second; to those who constantly fulfil all desires 
with the stage of being ignorant of the knowledge of desires; to such master almighty authority, powerful 
souls, BapDada’s love, remembrance and namaste. 
 
(Gangaben related news of Kanpur to BapDada): You are a constantly unshakeable and immovable soul.  
You experience the Father’s canopy of protection in every situation, do you not?  BapDada always keeps the 
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children safe.  You have always received the means of safety from the Father.  This is why you always have 
the Father’s hand of love and His company.  You have already practised “nothing new”.  Whatever 
happened, it was “nothing new”.  Whatever is happening, it is “nothing new”.  You automatically continue 
to receive touchings.  Rehearsals are taking place.  At such a time, what are the means of safety and service?  
What should be your form?  Rehearsals for this do take place.  At the end, there will be the victory amidst 
the cries of distress.  After the extreme, there will be the end and then the beginning of the new age.  At such 
a time, the drums of revelation will beat in everyone’s mind even against their conscious wish.  The scenes 
will be delicate but the drums of revelation will beat.  Therefore, you have gone beyond rehearsals.  You 
played your part as a carefree emperor.  You did very well.  You reached here and this is the form of love.  
Achcha. 
 
In terms of having thoughts, you are free from thoughts.  Whatever happened, “wah, wah”.  In this too, 
some will be benefited.  This is why there is benefit in being burnt and benefit in being saved.  You 
wouldn’t cry out in distress: Oh, I got burnt! No.  There is benefit in that too.  Just as you say “Wah, wah!” 
when you are saved, “Wah, I have been saved!” in this same way, let there be “Wah, wah”, even at the time 
of being burnt.  This is called a constant and stable stage.  It is your duty to save others, but something that 
is going to get burnt is going to get burnt anyway.  There are also many karmic accounts in this.  You are a 
carefree emperor anyway.  One went and you received a hundred-thousandfold.  This is the slogan of 
Brahmins.  It didn’t go, but you received.  This is why you are carefree.  It is probably because you are 
going to get something better.  This is why it is a game to get burnt and it is a game to be saved.  Both are 
games.  What people will see is to what extent you are a carefree emperor, that you are getting burnt and yet 
you are a carefree emperor because you are under the canopy of protection.  Those people become worried, 
“What will happen?  How will it happen?  Where will we get our food?  How will we carry on?”, whereas 
children don’t have that worry at all.  Achcha. 
 
You will now have to make preparations, will you not?  Don’t think about your leaving, but think about 
taking everyone with you.  You will grant everyone visions, make everyone satisfied, beat the drums of 
revelation and then leave.  Why should you leave before that?  You will return together with the Father.  
You will go having experienced the wonderful scenes of revelation.  Why should you miss out on this?  This 
power of the mind, the worship in the mind, the flowers of love – these final scenes are very wonderful.  It is 
a different matter as to who has a part in the advanced party.   However, it is very essential to see these 
scenes.  Those who complete something have accomplished the whole task.  This is why the Father comes at 
the end, and so He has done everything, has He not?  So, why don’t you also see this wonderful scene with 
the Father and return with Him?  Only some have this part.  Therefore, don’t have the thought of leaving.  If 
you had left, that too would have been fine.  However, you were saved and so that was also good.  If you go 
alone, you will still have to serve in the advance party.  Therefore, don’t think that you have to go (die).  
Think that you have to take everyone with you.  Achcha.  This is also an experience that has been added.  
Whatever happens adds a degree to your experience.  Just as others have a higher degree in their study, to 
experience this means to increase your degree. 
 
BapDada meeting groups: 
Do all of you consider yourselves to be masters of the self?  You are now masters of the self at the 
confluence age, and in the future you will have the kingdom of the world.  Only those who are masters of 
the self become those who have a right to the kingdom of the world.  Do you always consider yourself to be 
one who has a right to self-sovereignty, that those physical organs are your workers and that you make them 
function with a right over them?  Or do the physical organs become the king sometimes?  Are you 
yourselves the kings or do the physical organs sometimes become the kings?  Do the physical organs 
sometimes deceive you?  If you are deceived by anyone, then you have taken sorrow.  Deception brings you 
sorrow.  If there is no deception, there is no sorrow.  Therefore, you are those who stay in the happiness, 
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intoxication and power of being masters of the self.  The intoxication of being a master of the self is the 
intoxication that takes you into the flying stage.  Intoxication of limited things causes harm but this 
unlimited intoxication, unique spiritual intoxication, is one that enables you to attain happiness.  So you are 
a true king of the kingdom, whereas the kingdom of the subjects is a kingdom of chaos.  There has been a 
kingdom of kings from the beginning.  In the last birth there is the kingdom of the people.  So, you have 
now become those who have a right to the kingdom.  You were beggars for many births and now, from 
being beggars, you have become those who have a right.  BapDada always says: Children, remain happy, 
remain fruitful and prosperous.  The more you consider yourself to be an elevated soul, and perform 
elevated actions, speak elevated words and have elevated thoughts, then with these elevated thoughts, the 
more you will claim a right to the elevated world.  This self-sovereignty is your birthright.  It is this that will 
enable you to claim a right for birth after birth. 
 
Blessing: May you be an image that attracts everyone by merging your heart in the heart of the 

Comforter of Hearts and becoming an easy yogi. 
 To give your heart to the Comforter of Hearts means to make Him sit in your heart.  This is 

called easy yoga.  Your head will work where your heart is.  When you have given your heart 
and head, that is, your awareness, thoughts, and power to the Father, and you belong to the 
Father in your thoughts, words and deeds, then there is no margin to have any other thoughts or 
be attracted to anything in any way.  Then even your dreams will be based on this.  When you 
say that everything is “Yours” there cannot be any other attraction.  You will easily become an 
image that attracts everyone. 

Slogan: Let there be intense love in your heart for the Father and the divine family and you will 
continue to achieve success. 

* * * O M   S H A N T I * * * 
 
 


